
Esmeralda Nile Cruise 

          

Enjoy the Nile in an Ancient way, with the Comfort of Today 
Esmeralda Nile Cruise presents you with a luxurious experience. Sailing through 7000 years of 
civilization, the cruise takes you along the magical Pharaonic scenery from Luxor to Aswan, savoring the 
taste and feel of ancient Egypt. Enjoy free WiFi, room service & Non-smoking rooms. 

Accommodation 

              

Deluxe Cabin 
The cabins deliver a cozy atmosphere in a modern theme. Furnished with two comfortable beds and a 
study desk, the cabin carries all means of relaxation to rest and recall the events of an exciting day. The 
cabin also provides facilities for entertainment and refreshment while still being comfortable and secure. 

 



 

Presidential Suite 
Feel like a president in our Presidential Suites. The Presidential Suites provide you with the chance to 
reap all the benefits of going on a cruise, from the wonderful view of the Nile from all angles in the suite to 
the modern interior, the suites give the perfect feel of an elegant, relaxing cruise. Furnished with a king 
sized bed, decorative glass walls and warm colors, the suite offers comfort and elegance. 

Dining & Oulet 

                        

Garnet Restaurant 
Suited to fit up to 120 guests, Garnet restaurant offers a mouth-watering assortment of various delicious 
cuisines to dine from, ranging from Chinese, Italian, Oriental Egyptian, to other international cuisines. The 
restaurant provides an open buffet option with a rich selection of dishes for breakfast and lunch while a 
delectable à la carte menu is available for dinner. As a perfect addition to your meal, Garnet offers a fine 
selection of local and imported wine to make your meal more enjoyable. The awe-inspiring Nile view 
makes the perfect background for the restaurant during all your meals, to make them feel like a wonderful 
dream. 

 
 



              

Ruby Bar 
Our Ruby Bar provides you the perfect chance to experience a mix of relaxation, comfort, pleasure and a 
good time. Its combination of a cozy atmosphere and the modern design of the bar and the dance floor 
make it the perfect place to go to if you are searching for a fun night out. Make your way to the dance 
floor to let loose, have some fun or even make some unforgettable memories with friends and family. The 
music provided by the DJ is sure to get you on your feet. To add a little spice to your nights, the bar 
serves an excellent variety of cocktails and drinks. The excitement never ends with Esmeralda Nile 
Cruise. Ruby Bar hosts various entertainment shows and events ranging from Belly Dancing, Tanoura, 
and Oriental and Heritage music shows. 

              

Sun Deck 
Visit the sun deck to get a dosage of warm sun and beautiful scenery of the Nile. The sun deck is another 
place to go to get the most out of the holiday trip. Get a perfect tan while relaxing and letting your mind 
wander on a sun bed. If you feel hungry, you can grab a nice meal, snack, or drink to enjoy amidst the 
awe-striking view. Moreover, a journey cannot be complete without a steady swim. We give you the 
chance to keep on exercising, float around comfortably or have a nice time with your family and friends in 
our spacious swimming pool. Escape the heat with a refreshing swim among the beautiful views of the 
Nile.  

Enjoy your stay  
Golden Gates Travel 
+20 150 097 44 45 
Head office Address: 

47 Musab Bin Omair St. Luxor, Egypt 

www.goldengatestravel.com 
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