
GENERAL INFORMATION 

• Classification: 5 Stars Deluxe. 

What Distinguishes Our Cruise? 
  
Delight your senses and savour the most refined flavours on board Steigenberger 
Minerva. We offer an array of services, enriching your dining and gastronomic 
experiences. Immerse in relaxation therapy in our fully furnished cabins with spoiling on-
deck massage service. Spoil yourself with choices in a dream stay-cation that you have 
always desired. 

CABINS: Cabins Designed for Luxury! 

The cabins at Steigenberger Minerva are designed to be a warm and welcoming 

sanctuary delicately intended for guests seeking respite from the busy world on land. 

Experience inclusive amenities in the most spacious suites while taking in the gorgeous 

views of the Nile. Guests staying in suites can also enjoy exclusive seating in their private 

balconies.  

Standard Cabin: 

Infused with elegance through bespoke furnishings, stylish lighting, and en-suite 
bathrooms, our standard double cabins epitomize true luxury. These spacious cabins 
measuring 19m² are air-conditioned and feature amenities such as TV and WiFi. Revel in 
the plush comforts of the cabin and relax in our refreshing showers. Allow the Nile to 
captivate you daily as we offer an unparalleled cruising experience, where sophistication 
meets comfort at every turn. Immerse yourself in the epitome of luxury with our 
thoughtfully designed double cabins, ensuring each moment on board is a captivating 
journey. 
Satellite television 
Minibar 
Safe 
Hairdryer 
Private bathroom 
Air conditioning 

Standard Cabin for single use: 

Experience a haven of relaxation in our single cabins, offering 19m² of air-conditioned 
comfort that warmly welcomes you. Indulge in the spellbinding view of the Nile from the 
comfort of your cabin, complemented by amenities including TV and WiFi for your 
enjoyment. Embark on a journey of sophistication while cruising along the Nile, unlike any 
other, with us at Steigenberger Minerva. Your abode of comfort and tranquility awaits, 
promising an unparalleled experience on the serene waters. 
Minibar 
Hairdryer 
Private bathroom 
Safe 
Air conditioning 

 



Suite: 

Experience a lavish welcome to our suites at Steigenberger Minerva, where a deep red 
ambiance sets the tone. Retreat into your personal sanctuary, with spacious air-
conditioned suites spanning 39m². The furnishings, complemented by mood lighting, 
adapt to the various moods of the day. Indulge in the opulence of our suites, featuring a 
sleek TV, WiFi, and a Jacuzzi in the private bathrooms, enhancing your entire cruising 
experience. Immerse yourself in a realm of luxury and tranquility as you glide along the 
Nile in these carefully crafted suites, ensuring a voyage filled with opulence and 
unforgettable moments. 
Minibar 
Hairdryer 
Safe 
Bathtub 
Air conditioning 
Private bathroom 
Satellite television 

RESTAURANTS AND BARS: Delectable World Cuisines! 

Dive into the world of culinary wonders and relish the gastronomical delights created by 

our chefs. Each dining venue is unique in its offering and is designed to raise the bar of 

luxury dining along the Nile. 

Main Restaurant: 

Relish the culinary artworks of local and international cuisine as our talented chefs 
prepare a range of the finest delicacies at our main restaurant. Treat yourself to decadent 
dishes and take your tastebuds on a gastronomic trip.  

Sundeck Pool Bar: 

Life is better outdoors, whether it is exploring or enjoying a delicious casual fine dining 
lunch under the glorious Egyptian sun on a luxury cruise. Depending on the weather, our 
staff can serve a sumptuous lunch spread during sailing. 

Bar Timings: 8 AM to Midnight. 

RECREATIONAL FACILITIES: 

Expect nothing but the best of facilities in one of the finest luxury cruises. Steigenberger 

Minerva offers deluxe amenities that will make your trip even more delightful and 

comfortable. 

WiFi: 

Enjoy the comforts of a great connection in the middle of the Nile thanks to the 
complimentary wifi service while on board.  Stay in touch with friends and family and 
share how your Egyptian luxury cruise experience is going. 

 

 



Massage: 

Unwind after an adventurous day with a relaxing massage or just have a day dedicated to 
self-pampering and wellness. Choose from a wide range of massage styles and feel 
rejuvenated throughout the trip. 
Timings: 9 AM to 6 PM 

Gym: 

If you're concerned about maintaining your fitness routine while on a cruise, worry not. 
With breathtaking views, modern fitness equipment, and a variety of exercise options 
available on our sundeck, guests often find it difficult to step away from their workouts. 
Timings: 9 AM to 6 PM 

Laundry: 

Always at your beck and call, your clothes will be cleaned and cared for like never before. 
From catering to your every special need to quick turnaround times, our staff will make 
sure your clothes are always clean, neat and crisp. 

Gift Shop: 

Our gift shop has a wide variety of beautiful local souvenirs (and more) for you to choose 
from. Shopping at sea has never been more fun. Browse and buy keep-sakes for yourself 
and your friends. 

Doctor on call: 

Your health and safety is our priority. We always have a highly trained doctor on call who 
is able to provide routine and emergency care to passengers. 

SHIP FLOOR PLAN: 

Discover unique experiences with this 5-star cruiser, encompassing 5 luxurious decks 

featuring 73 Double Cabins, 2 Single Cabins and 2 Suites. Decked with a main 

restaurant, luxurious bars and a pool bar. 


